e~ V- 2017

ORDINANCE NO. 858 (17)

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING PART 13, CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE A, SECTION 13-101,
SECTION 13-103, AND SECTION 13-111 ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE
CODE AS AMENDED AND MODIFIED BY THE OKLAHOMA UNIFORM BUILDING
CODE COMMISSION AND ADOPTING LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO SAID CODE;
ADOPTING APPENDICES B, C, AND D OF SAID INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; AND
REPEALING ANY INCONSISTENT ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF MOORE, STATE OF
OKLAHOMA.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MOORE, OKLAHOMA
THAT PART 13, CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE A, SECTION 13-101, SECTION 13-103, AND
SECTION 13-111 ARE HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

CHAPTER 1 - FIRE PREVENTION CODE
ARTICLE A - FIRE CODES AND REGULATIONS

SECTION 13-101 - ADOPTION OF THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE PREVENHON CODE
AS AMENDED AND MODIFIED BY THE OKLAHOMA UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
COMMISION PURSUANT TO 59 O.8. § 1000.23.

A. There is hereby adopted by the city for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosmn that a certam eode known as
e H : as

0.8. § 1000.23, being th 5-tH and the whole thereof, save and
except such portlons as are heremafter deleted, modlﬁed or amended, of which code not less
than one copy has been and is filed in the office of the city clerk. The International Fire
Prevention-Code, as amended, is hereby adopted and incorporated as if set out at length herein,
and shall be incorporated and considered as a part of this code.

B. The following additions, amendments, or deletions are made to the Building Code adopted

herein:
‘Section Insert: The City of Moore, Oklahoma
101.1
Section Insert; Misdemeanor, five hundred ($500.00) dollars delete: or by imprisonment
409:3-109.4 not exceeding [10], or both such fine and imprisonment
|

i

Page 1



Delete: less than [amount] dollars or insert: more than five hundred ($500.00)

Section

1114 dollars

Section Delete Exception 2.: Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an
308.1.4 automatic sprinkler system

Delete Exception 3. : LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a
water capacity not greater than 2 % pounds {nominal I pound (0.45 kg) LP-gas

capacity/.

SECTION 13-103 - AMENDMENTS-TO-FRE-CODE- ADOPTION OF SPECIFIED

APPENDICES

Page 2



The following appendices to the 2015 International Fire Code are adopted and

incorporated by reference and made a part hereof as if fully set forth herein: Appendix B,
Appendix C, and Appendix D.

SECTION 13-111 - LIFE SAFETY CODE ADOPTED.

There is hereby adopted for the purposes of establishing rules and regulations for the
protection of the public safety from the hazards of fire, smoke, fumes, etc., that certain code known
as the 20135 National Fire Protection Association Life Safety Code —NFPA 101, being-partierlasly
thelatest-edition, adopted by the State of Oklahoma, thereof and the whole thereof, save and except
such portions thereof as are hereinafter deleted, modified, or amended. Not less than one copy has
been and now is filed in the office of the city clerk. The code is hereby adopted and incorporated
as fully as if set out at length herein. (Ord. No. 515(90), 9/17/90)

Severability: If any of the provisions of this ordinance are determined to be unconstitutional or
unlawful by any court of competent jurisdiction, the remainder shall be several and unaffected,

Repealer:  Any ordinance or parts thereof in conflict with this section are hereby repealed.

7Sy Ay S

GLENN LEWIS, Mayor

APPROVED AS TO FORM & LEGALITY:

RANDY BRINK, City Attorney

Page 3



